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The Massachusetts Medical Society is a professional association of over 25,000 physicians, 
physicians-in-training, and medical students across all clinical disciplines, organizations, and 
practice settings. The Medical Society is committed to advocating on behalf of patients, to 
provide them with a health care system that will best suit their needs, and on behalf of 
physicians, to help them deliver care of the highest quality and greatest value. The Medical 
Society appreciates this opportunity to provide comment and support for H.2550/S.1576 An 
Act Relative to Culturally Competent and Effective Health Care, and S. 1480, An 
Act Relative to Physician Workforce Data Collection. 

The Medical Society recognizes, and research shows, the important role a diverse physician 
workforce plays in improving patients’ access to care, patients’ perceptions of the care they 
receive, and their health outcomes, particularly for patients of color.1 The Medical Society is 
actively engaged in efforts to improve diversity within the physician workforce. We know that 
racial, ethnic, and cultural concordance improves patient health outcomes. In short, patients do 
better when they have a physician who understands them on deeper levels. We also know that 
the converse is true: a lack of diversity in the physician workforce can have negative impacts on 
health outcomes.2 A diverse physician workforce brings a wide range of perspectives, allowing 
providers to understand, communicate, and treat all patients more effectively. 
 
Enhancing diversity within the physician workforce requires an understanding of the current 
makeup of the physician workforce. To this end the Medical Society supports the collection of 
racial and ethnic data regarding the physician workforce, starting from medical school through 
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to professional practice. Further, the Medical Society promotes the tracking and reporting of 
demographic information pertaining to underrepresented groups in medicine, including 
expansion of the Medical Society’s own voluntary member demographic collection efforts. 
However, assembling a more complete picture of the physician workforce in Massachusetts 
requires robust participation of multiple health care stakeholders.  
 
H.2550/S.1576 and S.1480 would require the Board of Registration in Medicine (BORIM) to 
collect data and information regarding the cultural, ethnic, linguistic, and education 
composition of the physician workplace, and provide such data to the Center for Health 
Information and Analysis, to be made publicly available for the purposes of evaluating the 
impact of physician workforce diversity and health outcomes in the Commonwealth of 
Massachusetts. BORIM shall request all licensees when renewing their license, provide 
demographic information, including but not limited to race, ethnicity, and gender identity; 
linguistic information; medical specialty/subspecialty; primary and secondary practice location; 
duration of practice in Massachusetts; and  employment status.  Participation in data collection 

will be voluntary, and any data collected shall be aggregated, deidentified and shall not be sold. 

Collecting this workforce data and making it public will create a valuable tool for medical 
schools, hospitals, and physician practices to create programs to expand recruitment and 
retention of a more diverse physician workforce. It will additionally inform public policies 
designed to support the creation of a more diverse physician workforce that can address patient 
needs more appropriately.  

The urgency to collect and disseminate this data is only rising. Less than fifteen percent of active 
medical residents in the U.S. identify as Black or Hispanic, less than half that of the U.S. 
population who identify as such, 3 underscoring the inadequacy of current physician career 
pathways. However, more data is needed to understand the makeup of the Massachusetts 
physician workforce and to craft policy solutions that will diversify the Commonwealth’s 
workforce with the end goal of producing better health outcomes for our patients.   
 
While collection of this data is vitally important, we would encourage the committee to explore 
mechanisms for data collection that will streamline administrative efficiencies and avoid 
potential redundancies. For example, the Board of Registration in Medicine through its biennial 
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medical license renewal process currently collects demographic data for physicians. Rather than 
creating a new data reporting process, perhaps the BORIM data collection efforts could be 
enhanced and then coordinated and shared with CHIA for purposes of analysis. 
 
The collection of this data represents a critical first step toward advancing the Commonwealth’s 
goal of reducing racial and ethnic health disparities and improving health equity. For these 
reasons, we therefore ask the Committee to report H.2550/S.1576 and S.1480 out favorably. 
Thank you very much for your consideration of these important issues. We appreciate the 
opportunity to offer these comments.  

 
 
 

 


